
Sector focus

Weichai 120kW CE certified 
fuel cell system uses Ceres’ 
technology
Clean power provided by fuel cells 
brings simplicity, lower cost, 
improved efficiency and much 
lower carbon footprint.

Weichai in partnership with Ceres 
has developed a CE certified 
120kW solid oxide fuel cell power 
system. Weichai estimates that 
when its product reaches 1GW of 
distributed power deployed, it has 
the potential to save around 600 
million cubic metres of natural gas, 
compared with traditional natural 
gas generators.

Weichai’s system has the ability to 
start and stop up to four times faster 
than other technologies, whilst 
achieving power generation 
efficiency of more than 60% and 
cogeneration efficiency more than 
85%*. 

Click here to learn more
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